Having received professional advice concerning your FOI request this is the

council’s response.

1. Procurement of HR Services (??7???? HR)

o

Please confirm whether the Parish Council undertook a procurement or
tendering process before appointing ???? HR for HR consultancy work in
2024.

This information is already in the public domain and is therefore
exempted under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act.

If a procurement process did take place, please provide:
* The names of all companies or providers considered, and
* The quotes or proposals received from each of those companies.

This is commercial confidentiality and is therefore exempted under
Section 43 of the Freedom of Information Act.

2. Declaration of Pecuniary Interest - 7??? HR

o

Please confirm whether the Parish Council notified the District Council

The Parish Council does not hold this information.

Please provide copies of any correspondence, declarations, or
notifications relating to this matter.

The Parish Council does not hold this information.

3. Section 106 (S106) Funds - Time Limits and Availability

o

Please provide a breakdown of all S106 funds currently held by the Parish
Council, including:

* The project name/purpose

* The amount allocated

* The date each contribution was received

* The expiry date or time limit associated with each S106 contribution.

The Parish Council holds the following s106 Funds.

Community Facilities - £17,230.78
Community Grants Reserve - £4,577.37
Sports Grants Reserve - £5,753.70

Jubilee Park MUGA contingency - £4,000.00



o

This request is made to clarify conflicting information regarding whether
S106 funds are available only for a short term or for 10-20 years.

There is no time limit on when this needs to be spent.

4. Finance Committee Meetings — Play Parks & National Lottery Funding

o

Please provide copies (or minutes) of any Finance Committee or Parish
Council meetings where discussions took place regarding play parks and
National Lottery funding.

The Parish Council does not hold this information.

Please also provide information on whether any formal votes were taken
relating to applying solely for S106 funding instead of National Lottery
funding, and the outcome of any such votes.

This information is already in the public domain and is therefore
exempted under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act.

Council or committee meetings within the last six months.

This information is already in the public domain and is therefore
exempted under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act.

If held, please provide an attendance register or attendance records for
this period.

This information is already in the public domain and is therefore
exempted under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act.

6. CCTV and Audio Recording Equipment in Parish Council Offices

@)

Please confirm whether there is any CCTV and/or audio recording
equipment installed inside the Parish Council offices.

We do hold the information but will not be providing it as this is
exempted under Sections 38 and 43 of the Freedom of Information
Act.

If such equipment is present, please provide details of:

* The type of equipment

* The areas covered

* The purpose for which itis used, such as Parish Council Meetings.



o

We do hold the information but will not be providing it as this is
exempted under Sections 38 and 43 of the Freedom of Information
Act.

There is no NDA with ???? HR.

If an NDA does exist, please provide:

* The date it was signed

* The parties involved

* The general purpose of the NDA (excluding any information exempt
under the Act).

Not applicable.



